
Treasurer-Tax Collector
Public Auction Results

Alameda County Tax Defaulted Land

May 18, 2018 - May 21, 2018
March 16, 2018 - March 19, 2018

*

Parcel NumberItem Num Minimum Bid Bid AmountSite Results of Auction

1-115-51 $ 9,957.00 $ 35,500.00BRUSH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-122 $ 26,336.00 $ 33,300.005TH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-13-23 $ 11,903.00 $ 20,300.00BRUSH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-13-94 $ 56,444.00 $ 56,444.00715 5TH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-17-15 $ 48,639.00 $ 415,800.00407 CASTRO ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-18-26 $ 125,084.00 $ 141,084.00716 4TH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-207 $ 23,863.00 $ 171,800.00724 4TH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-218 $ 22,266.00 $ 22,266.00726 4TH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-229 $ 22,864.00 $ 28,100.00732 4TH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-2310 $ 11,731.00 $ 30,100.00734 4TH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-2411 $ 10,712.00 $ 20,300.00BRUSH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-2612 $ 21,106.00 $ 48,250.00410 BRUSH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-2813 $ 279,502.00 $ 279,502.00725 4TH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-2914 $ 80,725.00 $ 271,200.00715 4TH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-3415 $ 22,965.00 $ 22,965.00714 3RD ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-3516 $ 21,517.00 $ 21,517.00718 3RD ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-115-3617 $ 19,554.00 $ 19,554.003RD ST, OAKLAND Sold *

1-121-27-218 $ 141,548.00 $ 151,000.005TH ST, OAKLAND Sold *

3-11-1720 $ 3,484.00MARKET ST, OAKLAND No Bid
26-810-6751 $ 81,740.00MCKILLOP RD, OAKLAND No Bid
26-810-6852 $ 77,074.00MCKILLOP RD, OAKLAND No Bid
37A-2783-963 $ 36,230.00 $ 165,600.00DELMONT AVE, OAKLAND Sold
38-3240-24-267 $ 3,506.00 $ 7,300.00ELIZABETH ST, OAKLAND Sold
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48-5599-3591 $ 81,148.00MACARTHUR BLVD, OAKLAND No Bid
48H-7620-2699 $ 18,946.00 $ 18,946.00TUNNEL RD, OAKLAND Sold *

48H-7697-4100 $ 61,837.00PANORAMIC WAY, OAKLAND No Bid
48H-7697-71101 $ 34,749.00STATE PL, OAKLAND No Bid
81D-1630-27118 $ 42,618.00 $ 475,100.003222 GUILLERMO PL, HAYWARD Sold *
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